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Provericon and the ONLINE Rental Exchange Complete Integration

ONLINE Information Services, Inc. announced today an agreement to integrate its premier tenant
screening solution, the ONLINE Rental Exchange, with the Landlord Enterprise property management
system from Provericon.

Oct. 16, 2009 - PRLog -- Winterville, NC - ONLINE Information Services, Inc. announced today an
agreement to integrate its premier tenant screening solution, the ONLINE Rental Exchange, with the 
Landlord Enterprise property management system.  This integration will allow Provericon's property
management customers to view an instant credit risk decision, and run criminal background checks and
eviction searches all from within the Landlord Enterprise property management system. 

The ONLINE Rental Exchange will utilize application data entered in Landlord Enterprise to verify the
applicant's identity, return an accurate leasing decision according to the property's  policies, and highlight
unpaid property management bills and disconnects from ONLINE's unique national Rental and Utility
Exchange databases and other national sources.  Further, the integration will allow Landlord Enterprise
users to send their customer payment information to ONLINE automatically, helping to track customers
who do not pay their bills from property-to-property through ONLINE's national Rental Exchange database.

About the ONLINE Rental Exchange: 
Established in 1956 as a local merchant credit bureau, ONLINE Information Services, Inc. is currently the
nation's leading developer of risk management and debt recovery solutions for the Utility, Property
Management, Healthcare, and Mortgage industries.  Servicing Property Managers throughout the nation,
the ONLINE Rental Exchange is a rental-specific credit bureau with the single goal of providing the tools
necessary to eliminate bad debt and protect our customers' residents. For more information, visit the
website at http://www.onlinerentalexchange.com or contact:

ONLINE Sales
(866) 630-6400
sales@onlineis.com

About Provericon Software Development Inc.:
Provericon develops custom software applications for various business domains, including the property
management industry and other vertical markets.

LANDLORD ENTERPRISE allows the landlord or property manager to store, manage, and analyze
information about units, tenants, and leases.  It comes with powerful accounting and reporting capabilities,
vendor management modules, equipment/asset management features, and maintenance/repair log
capabilities.  Suitable for most mid-sized organizations, LANDLORD ENTERPRISE is cost-effective, and
its streamlined workflow makes it extremely easy to use. 

LANDLORD ENTERPRISE permits an unlimited number of tenants and units and is available for $179.99.
A free, non-expiring trial version is available for download from the product website at 
http://www.landlordenterprise.com.
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# # #

Servicing Property Managers nationwide, the ONLINE Rental Exchange is a rental-specific credit bureau
dedicated to eliminating bad debt and protecting our customers’ residents. Visit
www.ONLINERentalExchange.com to view a demo or request more info.

--- End ---
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