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FPG Food Display Cabinets

FPG food display cabinets have now been added to our range. FPG food displays are available in
refrigerated, heated, ambient & controlled ambient and in a variety of models and sizes.

March 8, 2010 - PRLog -- Future Products Group is a New Zealand based company with over 20 years
experience in the food and hospitality industry and manufactures high quality food display cabinets. From
its humble beginnings manufacturing check-out counters for supermarkets to its present day success with
offices in Australia, China, Germany and UK, FPG can deliver off the shelf food display cabinets to
complete store development and fit-out.

I had the pleasure of visiting the factory in 2002 and saw first hand the level of care and precision that is
involved in every step of the manufacturing process. Although computerised precision machinery is used
for cutting, bending and punching holes, every display cabinet is finished by hand and is fully tested prior
to dispatch. All cabinets are tested against a number of factors affecting their performance. Apart from
ambient temperatures, FPG cabinets are also tested for the maximum number of door openings per hour to
ensure optimum performance. That is why high volume outlets such as Mc Donalds, 7 Eleven, Muffin
Break and others have chosen FPG display cabinets.

FPG food displays are available in refrigerated, heated, ambient & controlled ambient and in a variety of
models and sizes. the display cabinets are available in benchtop models (In-line 3000 series) and free
standing models (In-line 4000 & 5000 series). The cabinets are modular in the sense that the profile and
measurements of all the cabinets within the same series match, so you can add on to your existing display
with a matching cabinet. All display cabinets can be customised with numerous options and in variety of
colours and finishes to suit any decor.

FPG display cabinets also keep food products fresh longer because of the higher relative humidity is 80%
inside the cabinet. This makes FPG cabinets the ideal display solution for any application.

Prestige Products http://www.prestigeproducts.com.au is proud to supply FPG food display cabinets to
franchised stores, cafes, delicatessens, supermarkets, convenience stores, service stations, cake shops,
hotels, clubs and takeaways for its build quality, consistent temperature and exceptional design. FPG
displays can be seen in Mc Donalds, Mc Cafes, Muffin Break, Coles Express, BP, 7 Eleven and United
Petroleum petrol stations all operating 24/7.

You can view FPG food display cabinets here: http://www.prestigeproducts.com.au/_catalog_46756/FPG

# # #

Prestige Products is Australia's premier website for catering equipment and hospitality industry. We supply
quality catering equipment at discounted wholesale prices Australia wide. We save you money on all
leading brands of catering equipment!
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