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FundVallarta Investments Announces The Release Of A New Website

fundVallarta Investments, Inc announces a new online resource for discovering real estate investment
opportunities in Puerto Vallarta, Mexico.

June 9, 2007 - PRLog -- Puerto Vallarta, Mexico June 9, 2007 -- fundVallarta Investments, Inc announces
a full online resource for discovering real estate investment opportunities in Puerto Vallarta, Mexico. With
conditions similar to the property boom in California, Puerto Vallarta is poised to become an international
performer with a solid return on investment. Visitors are able to access the significant knowledge-based
investment resource center at http://www.PrimePuertoVallartaRealEstate.com. Historic property
investments may point to a significant current investment opportunity in beachfront property in Mexico. 

PPVRE.com (http://www.PrimePuertoVallartaRealEstate.com) has been monitoring the trends in beach
front property and believes that Puerto Vallarta is not only desirable property, but has the potential to be a
significant investment opportunity. 

Did you know?

Puerto Vallarta has a population of 350,000 with 2 million visitors annually.

Puerto Vallarta has been named the best beach in Latin America by Travel and Leisure Magazine Readers
Survey (all 25 miles).

Humpback whales winter in the Bay every year. Dolphins, giant mantas, sea turtles, and over 100 species of
birds also live here.

The Puerto Vallarta area and surrounding region has a very active real estate market.

Source: Virtual Vallarta
 
David Crenshaw, Director, US Marketing and Investor Relations, has a very exciting story to tell. His
award winning investment strategies have helped to finalize millions of dollars in property acquisitions
each year. Regarding the potential boom in ocean front property in Puerto Vallarta, David Crenshaw notes,
"[This is] the best beachfront coast line for real estate investment and vacation getaways in the world." 

In addition, David has developed a website to assist those who may find themselves interested in real estate
investment opportunities in Puerto Vallarta.  The real estate investment boom in Mexico can provide
personal enjoyment in the, "beautiful Bay of Banderas, which comprises over 50 miles of pristine coastline
between Yelapa, Jalisco to the south and Rincon de Guayabitos, Nayarit to the north. Guayabito is located
in the heart of the Gold Coast of Nayarit, which is considered to be the present day 'California of Mexico'."

The partnership at PPVRE.com is well versed in both American and Mexican property laws and
cross-cultural investment opportunities.

David's website provides a listing of current offerings along with a comprehensive knowledge-based
resource center providing applicable articles for your consideration. A blog is also available to help answer
any questions you may have.
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# # #

fundVallarta Investments is a company whose mission is to deliver the most comprehensive investment
opportunities for investors looking to diversify their investment dollars into Mexican Beachfront Real
Estate in Puerto Vallarta.  We promise to provide our clients with accurate knowledge and the tools to
perform their due diligence.  It is our duty to perform and it is our guarantee that we will.

Website: www.PrimePuertoVallartaRealEstate.com

--- End ---
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